
VOLVO L70H 624793 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP412577
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

ROMCO INC1350 NE LOOP 820FORT WORTH, TXUS  76106Contact: CHRIS BITNERCBitner@romco.comT: F: (817)626-8983
Diagnosis
This is a baseline read-out on thesubmitted sample. We advise thatyou follow the  water drain-offprocedure for this component.Allmetal levels are normal indicating nocorrosion in the system. Excessivefree water present. The condition ofthe fuel is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO0081Unique No: 10634648Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 11 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 05944036 (Generated: 09/11/2023 13:41:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412577 --- --- ---Sample Date 31 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1355 --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 4 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.73 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.019 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 1 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 05944036 (Generated: 09/11/2023 13:41:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 624793\Diesel Fuel [VCP412577] 31 Aug 2023 @ 1355.0 hrs

