
[[SCOTT KRENZER]] VOLVO EC210CL 111140 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP417790
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: SCOTT KRENZER

SCOTT KRENZER1001 CHICI-SCOTTSVILLE RDSCOTTSVILLE, NYUS  14546Contact: SCOTT KRENZERjskrenz1@gmail.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. The filter changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.The iron level is severe. Thechromium level is severe. There is ahigh amount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. The oilis no longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: SCOSCONYUnique No: 10634800Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 12 Sep 2023
Report Id: SCOSCONY [WUSCAR] 05944188 (Generated: 02/16/2024 11:17:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT KRENZER - SCOSCONY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417790 VCP138302 VCP124310 VCP115384Sample Date 29 Aug 2023 02 Sep 2014 17 Dec 2012 04 Apr 2012Machine Hours 11599 5574 4291 3716Oil Hours 0 0 0 2000Oil Changed N/A Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status SEVERE NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 36.2 40.74 40.8 42.93Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.25 0.505 0.822 1.08
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 158073 76 590 16963Particles >6µm 26097 41 321 2421Particles >14µm 121 7 54 6ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/22/14 13/13/10 16/16/13 21/18/10Silicon ppm 98 6 13 10Sodium ppm 2 2 3 <1Potassium ppm 7 0 8 3
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 187 13 17 5Copper ppm 21 8 10 <1Lead ppm <1 5 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 1 0 0Aluminum ppm 18 3 3 2Chromium ppm 26 3 <1 0Molybdenum ppm <1 3 <1 1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 135 480 603 1670Magnesium ppm 9 3 4 3Zinc ppm 412 483 529 933Phosphorus ppm 330 377 451 789Barium ppm 2 0 0 0Boron ppm 2 2 5 48

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SCOSCONY [WUSCAR] 05944188 (Generated: 02/16/2024 11:17:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: SCOTT KRENZER - SCOSCONY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC210CL 111140\Hydraulic System [VCP417790] 29 Aug 2023 @ 11599.0 hrs

