
[[9127]] VOLVO A30G 742483 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP408900
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 9127

RELIABLE CONTRACTING2410 EVERGREEN RD SUITE 200GAMBRILLS, MDUS  21054Contact: RUSSELL HATFIELDRHATFIELD@RELIABLECONTRACTING.COMT: (410)987-1851F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated. Allother component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: RELMILUnique No: 10635506Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 Sep 2023
Report Id: RELMIL [WUSCAR] 05944894 (Generated: 09/10/2023 11:04:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSSELL HATFIELD - RELMIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP408900 VCP311351 --- ---Sample Date 30 Aug 2023 14 Jul 2021 --- ---Machine Hours 4028 2221 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.7 39.9 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 10 13 --- ---Sodium ppm 7 8 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 4 --- ---Copper ppm 154 75 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3914 3965 --- ---Magnesium ppm 23 14 --- ---Zinc ppm 1625 1560 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1267 1259 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 124 143 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RELMIL [WUSCAR] 05944894 (Generated: 09/10/2023 11:04:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSSELL HATFIELD - RELMIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 742483\Wet Disc Brake [VCP408900] 30 Aug 2023 @ 4028.0 hrs

