
VOLVO L90H 625926 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP339952
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT2500 WESTWARD DRSPRING GROVE, ILUS  60081Contact: JOHN DODGEjohn.dodge@altg.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The wear metal levels donot reflect the reported failure. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: ALTSPRUnique No: 10635553Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 10 Sep 2023
Report Id: ALTSPR [WUSCAR] 05944941 (Generated: 09/10/2023 14:04:37) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN DODGE - ALTSPR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP339952 --- --- ---Sample Date 28 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6025 --- --- ---Oil Hours 488 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.7 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 17 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 10 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 112 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4149 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 18 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1632 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1300 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 135 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ALTSPR [WUSCAR] 05944941 (Generated: 09/10/2023 14:04:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN DODGE - ALTSPR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 625926\Rear Axle [VCP339952] 28 Aug 2023 @ 6025.0 hrs

