
[[3495BR]] VOLVO L180F 11639 - DIESEL FUEL

Sample No: VCP435034
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 3495BR

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY CO200 BURKHOLDER DR.EPHRATA, PAUS  17522Contact: CHAD HERRONchad@hwyequip.comT: (717)859-3132F: (717)859-2698
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time.All metal levels arenormal indicating no corrosion in thesystem. The water content isnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fuel. Thecondition of the fuel is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: INSEPHUnique No: 10635583Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 11 Sep 2023
Report Id: INSEPH [WUSCAR] 05944971 (Generated: 09/20/2023 07:41:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - INSEPH

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435034 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 11979 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 FUEL CONDITIONSulfur ppm 4 --- --- ---Visc @ 40°C cSt 2.46 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.002 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: INSEPH [WUSCAR] 05944971 (Generated: 09/20/2023 07:41:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - INSEPH
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180F 11639\Diesel Fuel [VCP435034] 05 Sep 2023 @ 11979.0 hrs

