
[[GCA]] ELTEC 0173 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP424117
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: GCA

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC188 PERRY ROADBANGOR, MEUS  04401Contact: TED MENARDTed.Menard@chadwick-baross.comT: (207)942-4838F: (207)941-0856
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. The fluid was notspecified, however, a fluid matchindicates that this fluid is SAE 30Diesel Engine Oil.  Please confirm theoil type and grade, and specify thebrand of the oil on your nextsample.All component wear rates arenormal. Light fuel dilution occurring.The BN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Fuel is present in the oil and islowering the viscosity. The conditionof the oil is suitable for furtherservice.

Depot: VOLVO0007Unique No: 10635596Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0007 [WUSCAR] 05944984 (Generated: 09/11/2023 20:27:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TED MENARD - VOLVO0007

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424117 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4813 --- --- ---Oil Hours 300 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.5 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.0 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 71 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 85 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 3.5 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 33 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 64 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1122 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 1034 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1364 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1113 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0007 [WUSCAR] 05944984 (Generated: 09/11/2023 20:28:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TED MENARD - VOLVO0007
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ELTEC ELTEC 0173\Diesel Engine [VCP424117] 06 Sep 2023 @ 4813.0 hrs

