
[[327746 MOSAIC]] VOLVO L70H 624427 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP424504
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No: 327746 MOSAIC

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JIMMY PERSAUDjimmy.persaud@altg.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Gear wear is indicated.Elemental level of silicon (Si) abovenormal indicating ingress of sealmaterial. There is a lightconcentration of water present in thefluid. The fluid is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10635954Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 12 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05945342 (Generated: 09/12/2023 21:32:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIMMY PERSAUD - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424504 --- --- ---Sample Date 31 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4506 --- --- ---Oil Hours 40 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 29.5 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.109 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 21 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 29 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2305 --- --- ---Copper ppm 7 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 15 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 73 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 7 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 79 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 204 --- --- ---Barium ppm 7 --- --- ---Boron ppm 51 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05945342 (Generated: 09/12/2023 21:32:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JIMMY PERSAUD - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 624427\Transmission (Auto) [VCP424504] 31 Aug 2023 @ 4506.0 hrs

