
[[W-5549-1]] VOLVO L120H 632612 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP411778
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: W-5549-1

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC2025 COOK DRIVESALEM, VAUS  24153Contact: HUNTER TRIVELLINttrivellin@mcclung-logan.comT: (540)789-3750F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO9010Unique No: 10636138Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 05945526 (Generated: 09/11/2023 10:50:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUNTER TRIVELLIN - VOLVO9010

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411778 VCP385179 VCP338142 VCP351097Sample Date 06 Sep 2023 04 Oct 2022 01 Jun 2022 21 Mar 2022Machine Hours 4442 3037 2636 2063Oil Hours 0 500 630 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.0 13.7 13.2 13.9Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.3 8.0 8.5 8.3Oxidation (PA) % 80 50 67 47
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.5 0.3 0.2 0.1Nitration (PA) % 58 73 73 66Sulfation (PA) % 63 52 55 50Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 9 4 4 2Sodium ppm 2 0 1 <1Potassium ppm 0 0 1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 22 10 9 5Copper ppm <1 2 2 1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 2 1 0Aluminum ppm 12 4 3 2Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 44 20 53 20Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1724 2161 1255 2058Magnesium ppm 565 220 649 169Zinc ppm 1154 1063 920 979Phosphorus ppm 967 874 734 856Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 55 9 32 19

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 05945526 (Generated: 09/11/2023 10:50:41) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUNTER TRIVELLIN - VOLVO9010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632612\Diesel Engine [VCP411778] 06 Sep 2023 @ 4442.0 hrs

