
[[333969 SUPERIOR CONS]] VOLVO EC480EL 314599 - LEFT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP410346
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 333969 SUPERIOR CONS

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAJFARDELLA@ALTAEQUIPFL.COMT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Component wear metallevel(s) high for break in. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10642015Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05946056 (Generated: 09/12/2023 11:58:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP410346 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2481 --- --- ---Oil Hours 2481 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 190 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 38 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5235 --- --- ---Copper ppm 31 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 9 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 55 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 8 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 46 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 35 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 35 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 276 --- --- ---Barium ppm 8 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 05946056 (Generated: 09/12/2023 11:58:19) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 314599\Left Swing Drive [VCP410346] 17 Aug 2023 @ 2481.0 hrs

