
[[593679]] VOLVO A30G 742129 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP417071
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 593679

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10642025Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 11 Sep 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05946066 (Generated: 09/11/2023 16:52:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417071 VCP386645 VCP360656 VCP288445Sample Date 12 Aug 2023 21 Dec 2022 11 Apr 2022 22 Oct 2020Machine Hours 9111 8052 7176 5286Oil Hours 1000 2000 1000 1000Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 256 277 276 193
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 7 6 5 3Sodium ppm <1 <1 <1 2Potassium ppm 2 <1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 67 269 274 224Copper ppm <1 4 3 6Lead ppm 0 <1 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 0 1 <1 0Chromium ppm 1 5 5 4Molybdenum ppm 1 4 4 6Nickel ppm <1 4 3 2Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 4 4 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 92 78 71 218Magnesium ppm 15 18 17 6Zinc ppm 116 61 51 87Phosphorus ppm 997 981 1023 1147Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 162 171 204 192

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05946066 (Generated: 09/11/2023 16:52:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 742129\Front Axle [VCP417071] 12 Aug 2023 @ 9111.0 hrs

