
VOLVO L120H 632749 - TRANSMISSION

Sample No: VCP0007444
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY8750 PHILIPS HWYJACKSONVILLE, FLUS  32256Contact: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNTcatherine.anastasio@wearcheck.comT: F: (904)737-1260
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0092Unique No: 10642097Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 12 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05946138 (Generated: 09/13/2023 11:43:01) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP0007444 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4905 --- --- ---Oil Hours 4905 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 25.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 81 --- --- ---Copper ppm 11 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 7 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 5 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 120 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 42 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 182 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 40 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0092 [WUSCAR] 05946138 (Generated: 09/13/2023 11:43:04) Rev: 1 Submitted By: TECHNICIAN ACCOUNT
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632749\Transmission [VCP0007444] 06 Sep 2023 @ 4905.0 hrs

