
VOLVO A40G 352676 - BOGIE/CENTER AXLE

Sample No: VCP412494
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a high amount ofvisible silt present in the sample.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10642705Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 13 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05946746 (Generated: 09/13/2023 08:55:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412494 VCP355249 --- ---Sample Date 05 Sep 2023 08 Jun 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 4379 2274 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 291 296 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 1.70 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 18 13 --- ---Sodium ppm 5 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 5 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 174 55 --- ---Copper ppm 2 <1 --- ---Lead ppm 0 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 5 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 7 7 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 5 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 75 69 --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 22 --- ---Zinc ppm 31 32 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1013 948 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 189 136 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 05946746 (Generated: 09/13/2023 08:55:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352676\Bogie/Center Axle [VCP412494] 05 Sep 2023 @ 4379.0 hrs

