
[[X17729]] VOLVO EC480EL 311309 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP418682
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: X17729

SCOTT EQUIPMENT COMPANY LLC - Jackson3860 I-55 SouthJACKSON, MSUS  39212Contact: D MCDOUGALDMCDOUGAL@SCOTTCOMPANIES.COMT: F: (601)326-3359
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Appearance is milky.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8771Unique No: 10643553Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 13 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8771 [WUSCAR] 05947594 (Generated: 09/13/2023 21:25:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: D MCDOUGAL - VOLVO8771

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418682 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 4255 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 409 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 8.92 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 332 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 10 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1602 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 4 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 137 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 18 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 7 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 13 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 113 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 23 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 104 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 816 --- --- ---Barium ppm <1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 84 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8771 [WUSCAR] 05947594 (Generated: 09/13/2023 21:25:15) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: D MCDOUGAL - VOLVO8771
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 311309\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP418682] 05 Sep 2023 @ 4255.0 hrs

