
[[326994]] OLGPLAN D40PS 03981 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP381620
Oil Type: RED COOLANT
Job No: 326994

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLCG-3283 S. DORT HIGHWAYBURTON, MIUS  48529Contact: JOHN BUCKNERjohn.buckner@altaequipment.comT: (810)744-4840F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend drain/flush system,and refill with 50/50 antifreeze watermixture. Sediment present. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: VOLVO5023Unique No: 10643589Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 13 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5023 [WUSCAR] 05947630 (Generated: 09/13/2023 21:26:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN BUCKNER - VOLVO5023

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP381620 --- --- ---Sample Date 24 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 85 --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.04 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 59.7 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -56 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance sediment --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---Sand/Dirt scalar NONE --- --- ---Debris scalar NONE --- --- ---Precipitate scalar NONE --- --- ---Silt scalar NONE --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5023 [WUSCAR] 05947630 (Generated: 09/13/2023 21:26:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN BUCKNER - VOLVO5023
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	OLGPLAN OLGPLAN D40PS 03981\Coolant [VCP381620] 24 Aug 2023 @ 85.0 hrs

