
NOT GIVEN VCP414384 (S/N NO INFO ON SIF/BOTTLE) - UNKNOWN COMPONENT

Sample No: VCP414384
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

117 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GREENVILLE2002 N GREENE STGREENVILLE, NCUS  27834Contact: ALLEN WILLIAMSallen.williams@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (704)494-8197
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify thecomponent make and model withyour next sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe sample. The condition of thesample is acceptable for the time inservice.

Depot: VOLVO8769Unique No: 10644263Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05948304 (Generated: 09/15/2023 07:30:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALLEN WILLIAMS - VOLVO8769

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP414384 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.4 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 20 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 10 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 44 --- --- ---Copper ppm 107 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 8 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3510 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1601 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1365 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 125 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05948304 (Generated: 09/15/2023 07:30:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALLEN WILLIAMS - VOLVO8769
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	NOT GIVEN VCP414384 (S/N NO INFO ON SIF/BOTTLE)\Unknown Component [VCP414384] 11 Sep 2023 @ .0 hrs

