
[[19241]] VOLVO A45G 342614 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP407571
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W140
Job No: 19241

GLOVER CONSTRUCTION CO. INC.4493 US HWY 301 NPLEASANT HILL, NCUS  27866Contact: BRENDA GAYbgay@gloverconstruction.comT: F: (252)536-5078
Diagnosis
We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of metal. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Highconcentration of visible metalpresent. All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: GLOPLEUnique No: 10644273Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Sep 2023
Report Id: GLOPLE [WUSCAR] 05948314 (Generated: 09/14/2023 12:53:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENDA GAY - GLOPLE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP407571 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Jul 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 3572 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 224 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 109 --- --- ---Copper ppm 1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 198 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 28 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 157 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 411 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 14 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GLOPLE [WUSCAR] 05948314 (Generated: 09/14/2023 12:53:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENDA GAY - GLOPLE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342614\Rear Axle [VCP407571] 14 Jul 2023 @ 3572.0 hrs

