
[[595813 DIPRO]] SENNEBOGAN 835 830.0.2853 - FRONT RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP413264
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: 595813 DIPRO

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL CONZpaul.conz@altg.comT: (313)348-8861F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10645537Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 15 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05949578 (Generated: 09/15/2023 14:27:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413264 VCP426793 VCP380835 VCP384985Sample Date 05 Sep 2023 29 Mar 2023 04 Jan 2023 08 Nov 2022Machine Hours 4123 3387 2827 6057Oil Hours 1000 1000 1000 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 141 145 152 114
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 2 4 28 2Sodium ppm 2 <1 4 3Potassium ppm 1 1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 48 53 64 17Copper ppm 44 45 7 2Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 2 2 0Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 0Molybdenum ppm 0 0 <1 0Nickel ppm <1 0 3 0Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 3 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 7 <1 3 126Magnesium ppm 1 0 1 2Zinc ppm 55 26 5 37Phosphorus ppm 1012 2316 1752 1245Barium ppm 2 0 0 0Boron ppm 51 182 114 48

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 05949578 (Generated: 09/15/2023 14:27:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGAN SENNEBOGAN 835 830.0.2853\Front Right Final Drive [VCP413264] 05 Sep 2023 @ 4123.0 hrs

