
[[HASLAM]] PONSSE A120392 - BASE - CRANE

Sample No: VCP406216
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: HASLAM

CHADWICK-BAROSS INC188 PERRY ROADBANGOR, MEUS  04401Contact: TED MENARDTed.Menard@chadwick-baross.comT: (207)942-4838F: (207)941-0856
Diagnosis
We recommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Bearingand/or bushing wear is indicated.Gear wear is indicated. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The oil is no longerserviceable as a result of theabnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: VOLVO0007Unique No: 10645555Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 15 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0007 [WUSCAR] 05949596 (Generated: 09/15/2023 15:36:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TED MENARD - VOLVO0007

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP406216 --- --- ---Sample Date 01 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1839 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 126 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 122 --- --- ---Copper ppm 586 --- --- ---Lead ppm 42 --- --- ---Tin ppm 48 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 16 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 3 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 76 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 801 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 185 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0007 [WUSCAR] 05949596 (Generated: 09/15/2023 15:36:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TED MENARD - VOLVO0007
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	PONSSE PONSSE A120392 - BASE\Crane [VCP406216] 01 Sep 2023 @ 1839.0 hrs

