
[[606027]] VOLVO A40 314620 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP412695
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: 606027

ORANGE COUNTY SOLID WASTE5901 YOUNG PINE ROADORLANDO, FLUS  32829Contact: MICHAEL BEEBEmichael.beebe@ocfl.netT: (407)836-6652F: (407)836-6650
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the fuelinjection system. Oil and filter changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. Resample at the next serviceinterval to monitor.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of fuel present inthe oil. Fuel is present in the oil and islowering the viscosity. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: ORAORLUnique No: 10645910Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Sep 2023
Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 05949951 (Generated: 09/19/2023 15:13:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412695 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 10526 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.1 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.3 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 78 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 75 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 58 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 3.5 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 6 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 36 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 39 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 48 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1775 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 570 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1151 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 937 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 22 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 05949951 (Generated: 09/19/2023 15:13:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40 314620\Diesel Engine [VCP412695] 05 Sep 2023 @ 10526.0 hrs

