
[[606491]] VOLVO 220 315389 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP412218
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 606491

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. NOTE:one of two samples received withsame ID and sampling date.Gearwear is indicated. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10646472Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 18 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05950513 (Generated: 09/19/2023 01:02:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412218 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1133 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 176 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 33 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 12 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 665 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 10 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 10 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 8 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm <1 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 19 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 283 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 3 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05950513 (Generated: 09/19/2023 01:02:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO 220 315389\Front Left Final Drive [VCP412218] 08 Sep 2023 @ 1133.0 hrs

