
LIEBHERR LH40 137239 - FRONT DIFFERENTIAL

Sample No: VCPMC133678
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

FINKBINER EQUIPMENT CO.15 W 400 N FRONTAGE RDBURR RIDGE, ILUS  60527Contact: DON FITZGERALDdfitzgerald@finkbiner.comT: (815)546-8991F: (630)654-3792
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: LEC0033Unique No: 10646919Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Sep 2023
Report Id: LEC0033 [WUSCAR] 05950960 (Generated: 09/27/2023 06:37:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DON FITZGERALD - LEC0033

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCPMC133678 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2230 --- --- ---Oil Hours 2230 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 185 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 4 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 --- --- ---Copper ppm 25 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 55 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 33 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1135 --- --- ---Barium ppm 389 --- --- ---Boron ppm 2 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEC0033 [WUSCAR] 05950960 (Generated: 09/27/2023 06:37:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DON FITZGERALD - LEC0033
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	LIEBHERR LIEBHERR LH40 137239\Front Differential [VCPMC133678] 05 Sep 2023 @ 2230.0 hrs

