
[[19436 BALFOUR BEATTY]] VOLVO EC250E 316215 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP417107
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 19436 BALFOUR BEATTY

117 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - GREENVILLE2002 N GREENE STGREENVILLE, NCUS  27834Contact: BRANDON JENKINSBRANDON.JENKINS@ASCENDUMMACHINERY.COMT: F: (704)494-8197
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO8769Unique No: 10647166Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 16 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05951207 (Generated: 09/16/2023 01:17:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417107 VCP410177 VCP383316 ---Sample Date 11 Sep 2023 03 May 2023 10 Feb 2023 ---Machine Hours 2011 1511 1190 ---Oil Hours 500 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 13.7 13.0 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.6 8.4 10.5 ---Oxidation (PA) % 78 53 80 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 ---Nitration (PA) % 51 42 56 ---Sulfation (PA) % 61 45 63 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 5 4 5 ---Sodium ppm 3 1 2 ---Potassium ppm 9 4 9 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 3 6 ---Copper ppm 6 8 63 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm 7 1 4 ---Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 45 62 47 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm <1 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1716 1243 1736 ---Magnesium ppm 620 961 476 ---Zinc ppm 1236 1323 1125 ---Phosphorus ppm 1017 1044 888 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 42 14 47 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8769 [WUSCAR] 05951207 (Generated: 09/16/2023 01:17:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON JENKINS - VOLVO8769
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250E 316215\Diesel Engine [VCP417107] 11 Sep 2023 @ 2011.0 hrs

