
[[SWO-065667]] VOLVO A45G 352708 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP428984
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: SWO-065667

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The amount and size ofparticulates present in the system areacceptable. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10647275Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Sep 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05951316 (Generated: 09/19/2023 10:49:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP428984 VCP424604 VCP402462 VCP369290Sample Date 11 Sep 2023 06 Jul 2023 24 Mar 2023 08 Nov 2022Machine Hours 4418 3920 3429 2956Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.5 44.4 43.9 44.5Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.38 0.31 0.31 0.40
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 1620 281 2527 1756Particles >6µm 395 94 704 285Particles >14µm 24 11 62 23ISO 4406:1999 (c) 18/16/12 15/14/11 19/17/13 18/15/12Silicon ppm 6 6 6 5Sodium ppm <1 0 1 <1Potassium ppm <1 <1 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 9 5 6Copper ppm 6 2 7 2Lead ppm 2 3 3 2Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 2 1 <1Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 0 0Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 0 0 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 79 76 73 75Magnesium ppm <1 0 1 0Zinc ppm 430 441 443 392Phosphorus ppm 354 326 334 330Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 05951316 (Generated: 09/19/2023 10:50:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352708\Hydraulic System [VCP428984] 11 Sep 2023 @ 4418.0 hrs

