
[[19473]] VOLVO L90H 623682 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP421692
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: 19473

IAA - INSURANCE AUTO AUCTIONS - CLAYTON60 SADISCO RDCLAYTON, NCUS  27520Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Thecarboxylate level of this fluid isacceptable. The glycol level isacceptable. The pH level of this fluidis within the acceptable limits.

Depot: INSCLAUnique No: 10647843Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: INSCLA [WUSCAR] 05951884 (Generated: 10/02/2023 23:05:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - INSCLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP421692 --- --- ---Sample Date 05 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12074 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 7.98 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 58.9 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -54 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: INSCLA [WUSCAR] 05951884 (Generated: 10/02/2023 23:05:59) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - INSCLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 623682\Coolant [VCP421692] 05 Sep 2023 @ 12074.0 hrs

