
[[20790]] VOLVO ECR88 217893 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP413704
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 20790

520 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - KNOXVILLE5730 RUTLEDGE PIKEKNOXVILLE, TNUS  37924Contact: BRANDON GRANTbrandon.grant@ascendummachinery.comT: (865)525-1845F: (865)525-0251
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thecopper level is abnormal. In theabsence of other significant wearmetals, suspect copper due tosources other than wear (i.e. coolingcore). All other metal levels aretypical for a new componentbreaking in. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0124Unique No: 10648355Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 19 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0124 [WUSCAR] 05952396 (Generated: 09/19/2023 16:24:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON GRANT - VOLVO0124

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413704 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 588 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.8 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 65 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 71 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 62 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 11 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 5 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 22 --- --- ---Copper ppm 114 --- --- ---Lead ppm <1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 5 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 26 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2281 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 156 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1003 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 866 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 29 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0124 [WUSCAR] 05952396 (Generated: 09/19/2023 16:24:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRANDON GRANT - VOLVO0124
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR88 217893\Diesel Engine [VCP413704] 12 Sep 2023 @ 588.0 hrs

