
[[A10964]] VOLVO A30D 74083 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP421857
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: A10964

DYER QUARRYP.O. BOX 188, 1275 ROCK HOLLOW ROADBIRDSBORO, PAUS  19508Contact: MATT MCCLELLANDmatt.mcclelland@dyerquarry.comT: F: (610)582-2304
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor. No other corrective action isrecommended at this time.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Light fuel dilution occurring. Noother contaminants were detected inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: DYEBIRUnique No: 10648358Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 19 Sep 2023
Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 05952399 (Generated: 09/19/2023 09:20:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP421857 VCP427165 VCP396676 VCP399929Sample Date 29 Aug 2023 30 Jun 2023 21 Mar 2023 01 Mar 2023Machine Hours 13740 13545 13265 13200Oil Hours 250 250 0 258Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd ChangedSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL MARGINAL SEVERE
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 11.6 12.3 11.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.7 7.5 7.9 9.3Oxidation (PA) % 39 49 42 69
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.5 0.8 0.2 0.5Nitration (PA) % 58 69 47 60Sulfation (PA) % 45 53 45 58Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 2.9 3.7 2.3 5.9Silicon ppm 7 12 12 45Sodium ppm 3 4 3 11Potassium ppm <1 2 3 10
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 18 7 19Copper ppm 2 3 1 7Lead ppm 1 1 <1 2Tin ppm 2 2 <1 3Aluminum ppm 3 <1 0 2Chromium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 29 17 16 31Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 1Titanium ppm 5 3 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1963 2035 1972 1797Magnesium ppm 391 207 187 255Zinc ppm 1136 1043 1053 1089Phosphorus ppm 990 867 894 885Barium ppm 0 0 2 0Boron ppm 23 20 20 100

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: DYEBIR [WUSCAR] 05952399 (Generated: 09/19/2023 09:20:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MCCLELLAND - DYEBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30D 74083\Diesel Engine [VCP421857] 29 Aug 2023 @ 13740.0 hrs

