
[[A10991]] VOLVO EC480DL 210065 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP424780
Oil Type: MOBIL HYDRAULIC OIL AW 46
Job No: A10991

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Theamount and size of particulatespresent in the system are acceptable.The AN level is acceptable for thisfluid. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10648650Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05952691 (Generated: 09/20/2023 09:52:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424780 VCP399154 VCP358841 VCP264612Sample Date 26 Aug 2023 13 Jan 2023 12 May 2022 24 Feb 2020Machine Hours 8275 7764 7231 5900Oil Hours 2000 0 0 1000Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.2 36.8 38.6 39.6Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.60 0.58 0.61 0.477
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 15467 84000 65887 2710Particles >6µm 329 38120 6370 447Particles >14µm 14 5278 139 20ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/16/11 24/22/20 23/20/14 19/16/11Silicon ppm 8 6 4 3Sodium ppm <1 0 2 <1Potassium ppm 0 2 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 10 13 11 6Copper ppm 14 19 14 7Lead ppm <1 <1 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 1 2 <1Chromium ppm 2 2 1 <1Molybdenum ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm <1 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1553 783 650 406Magnesium ppm 22 8 7 4Zinc ppm 896 718 645 609Phosphorus ppm 702 559 571 446Barium ppm 0 1 0 0Boron ppm 42 21 19 10

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05952691 (Generated: 09/20/2023 09:52:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480DL 210065\Hydraulic System [VCP424780] 26 Aug 2023 @ 8275.0 hrs

