
[[A10991]] VOLVO EC480DL 210065 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP424770
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 80W90
Job No: A10991

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10648988Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 19 Sep 2023
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05953029 (Generated: 09/19/2023 20:36:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424770 VCP399151 VCP246384 VCP248798Sample Date 26 Aug 2023 13 Jan 2023 24 Feb 2020 29 Aug 2019Machine Hours 8275 7764 5900 5480Oil Hours 1000 0 1000 500Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL SEVERE SEVERE ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 165 172 282 282
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 88 674 493 240Sodium ppm 3 19 13 9Potassium ppm 5 25 31 11
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 230 1777 1063 475Copper ppm 20 104 90 54Lead ppm 0 2 0 <1Tin ppm 1 10 0 4Aluminum ppm 10 117 77 37Chromium ppm 2 16 12 5Molybdenum ppm <1 2 <1 2Nickel ppm <1 10 4 2Titanium ppm 1 11 7 3Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 3 13 10 4Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 18 114 99 85Magnesium ppm <1 47 36 25Zinc ppm 0 23 68 67Phosphorus ppm 982 1019 832 786Barium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Boron ppm 167 161 117 104

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05953029 (Generated: 09/19/2023 20:36:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480DL 210065\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP424770] 26 Aug 2023 @ 8275.0 hrs

