
[[A10936]] VOLVO A30G 742440 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP421858
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILUBE HD 80W90
Job No: A10936

K C CONSTRUCTION1737 STOUT DRIVEIVYLAND, PAUS  18974Contact: DUKE D.duked@kcconstruct.comT: (267)784-7337F:  x:
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light concentration ofwater present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: KCCIVYUnique No: 10648992Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 19 Sep 2023
Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05953033 (Generated: 09/20/2023 10:06:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP421858 VCP361604 VCP261248 VCP253737Sample Date 25 Aug 2023 05 Mar 2022 30 Oct 2020 13 Mar 2020Machine Hours 3180 1990 1040 525Oil Hours 1180 1000 1040 525Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 286 293 209 62.5
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.224 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 7 4 2 2Sodium ppm 1 <1 2 5Potassium ppm 2 0 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 83 113 97 155Copper ppm 6 3 4 10Lead ppm 0 0 0 2Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 2 2 2 5Molybdenum ppm <1 2 3 12Nickel ppm <1 0 0 2Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 3 4 12Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 78 64 55 54Magnesium ppm 0 3 5 <1Zinc ppm 24 14 12 5Phosphorus ppm 1072 1072 1074 1411Barium ppm 0 0 <1 1Boron ppm 211 187 184 178

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05953033 (Generated: 09/20/2023 10:06:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 742440\Front Axle [VCP421858] 25 Aug 2023 @ 3180.0 hrs

