
[[A10935]] VOLVO A40G 342450 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP424774
Oil Type: MOBIL WB 102
Job No: A10935

K C CONSTRUCTION1737 STOUT DRIVEIVYLAND, PAUS  18974Contact: DUKE D.duked@kcconstruct.comT: (267)784-7337F:  x:
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The filter change at thetime of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.The copper level isabnormal. All other component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: KCCIVYUnique No: 10648993Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 19 Sep 2023
Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05953034 (Generated: 09/20/2023 09:53:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424774 VCP307580 VCP294042 ---Sample Date 24 Aug 2023 06 Aug 2021 08 Jan 2021 ---Machine Hours 5915 4110 3925 ---Oil Hours 2000 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.5 43.0 45.2 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 23 16 ---Sodium ppm 7 8 6 ---Potassium ppm 1 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 72 38 ---Copper ppm 123 227 226 ---Lead ppm 2 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm <1 1 <1 ---Chromium ppm 0 3 1 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 2 2 ---Nickel ppm 1 6 5 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 3 2 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3462 3706 3355 ---Magnesium ppm 8 21 11 ---Zinc ppm 1540 1436 1431 ---Phosphorus ppm 1270 1188 1210 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 126 115 86 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 05953034 (Generated: 09/20/2023 09:53:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 342450\Wet Disc Brake [VCP424774] 24 Aug 2023 @ 5915.0 hrs

