
[[A10854]] VOLVO L120H 632331 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP416827
Oil Type: MOBIL WB 102
Job No: A10854

WASTE MANAGEMENT - TELFORD400 PROGRESS DRTELFORD, PAUS  18969-1191Contact: EDWARD ROGENERerogener@wm.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oilviscosity is higher than normal. Thisplus the additive levels indicates theaddition of a different brand, or typeof oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: WASTELUnique No: 10648995Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 19 Sep 2023
Report Id: WASTEL [WUSCAR] 05953036 (Generated: 09/20/2023 09:07:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EDWARD ROGENER - WASTEL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416827 VCP416385 VCP406370 VCP386457Sample Date 28 Aug 2023 14 Jun 2023 03 Apr 2023 10 Jan 2023Machine Hours 11470 10995 10495 10007Oil Hours 500 1000 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 179 41.4 40.5 41.7
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.283 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 12 13 14 12Sodium ppm <1 6 8 9Potassium ppm 2 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 415 49 60 46Copper ppm 7 <1 0 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 2 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 2 1 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 5 <1 1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 7 3741 3736 3681Magnesium ppm 0 18 23 21Zinc ppm 28 1498 1477 1378Phosphorus ppm 398 1225 1179 1156Barium ppm 0 2 0 0Boron ppm 2 126 126 113

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WASTEL [WUSCAR] 05953036 (Generated: 09/20/2023 09:07:36) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EDWARD ROGENER - WASTEL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632331\Rear Axle [VCP416827] 28 Aug 2023 @ 11470.0 hrs

