
[[129754 STREETER DOZI]] VOLVO EC480EL 311202 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP419540
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: 129754 STREETER DOZI

THE GW VAN KEPPEL COMPANY8233 WEST RENOOKLAHOMA CITY, OKUS  73127Contact: CHARLES HAMILTONchamilton@vankeppel.comT: (405)495-0606F: (405)495-7603
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. There is no indicationof any contamination in the coolant.Carboxylate test failed. The glycollevel is acceptable. The pH level ofthis fluid is within the acceptablelimits.

Depot: VOLVO0052Unique No: 10649096Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0052 [WUSCAR] 05953137 (Generated: 10/02/2023 05:57:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES HAMILTON - VOLVO0052

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP419540 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 6158 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.51 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 0 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 47.5 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -28 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0052 [WUSCAR] 05953137 (Generated: 10/02/2023 05:57:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES HAMILTON - VOLVO0052
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480EL 311202\Coolant [VCP419540] 11 Sep 2023 @ 6158.0 hrs

