
VOLVO L90H 5624326 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP416431
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 101
Job No:

CITY CARTING221 OLD GATE LNMILFORD, CTUS  06460Contact: John LINARESjlinares@win-waste.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light concentration ofwater present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: CITMILCONUnique No: 10649492Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 05953533 (Generated: 10/02/2023 07:08:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: John LINARES - CITMILCON

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416431 VCP407778 VCP281576 ---Sample Date 08 Sep 2023 24 May 2023 30 Nov 2020 ---Machine Hours 7531 7068 3192 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd N/A Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.3 39.2 39.1 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.260 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 13 12 12 ---Sodium ppm 10 0 7 ---Potassium ppm 7 2 5 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 41 17 ---Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 0 ---Tin ppm <1 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 1 1 1 ---Nickel ppm <1 0 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm 2 <1 2 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 4166 4112 4239 ---Magnesium ppm 19 16 11 ---Zinc ppm 1700 1614 1704 ---Phosphorus ppm 1350 1286 1348 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 130 139 123 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: CITMILCON [WUSCAR] 05953533 (Generated: 10/02/2023 07:08:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: John LINARES - CITMILCON
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90H 5624326\Front Axle [VCP416431] 08 Sep 2023 @ 7531.0 hrs

