
[[11097]] VOLVO ECR235D 210351 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP440556
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: 11097

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10649669Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05953710 (Generated: 09/20/2023 03:19:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440556 VCP407486 VCP399882 VCP378619Sample Date 13 Sep 2023 04 May 2023 13 Jan 2023 08 Sep 2022Machine Hours 8650 8170 7920 7730Oil Hours 0 250 0 250Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.9 10.5 13.3 13.6Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 6.5 7.4 8.8 8.5Oxidation (PA) % 47 46 54 62
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 65 63 57 78Sulfation (PA) % 50 48 50 55Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 1.1 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 6 10 5Sodium ppm 2 <1 <1 4Potassium ppm 2 <1 2 5
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 17 26 14Copper ppm 2 1 1 <1Lead ppm <1 0 0 1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 1Aluminum ppm 4 10 4 3Chromium ppm <1 <1 2 1Molybdenum ppm 14 23 33 71Nickel ppm <1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 2 11 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2376 1868 1669 1855Magnesium ppm 148 344 383 112Zinc ppm 1203 1151 1042 1168Phosphorus ppm 961 916 915 942Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 4 9 34 53

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05953710 (Generated: 09/20/2023 03:19:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235D 210351\Diesel Engine [VCP440556] 13 Sep 2023 @ 8650.0 hrs

