
[[W06005544 THOMAS BUI]] VOLVO ECR305CL 110653 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP411783
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: W06005544 THOMAS BUI

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC2025 COOK DRIVESALEM, VAUS  24153Contact: HUNTER TRIVELLINttrivellin@mcclung-logan.comT: (540)789-3750F: 
Diagnosis
The filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.The iron levelis abnormal. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is a highamount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO9010Unique No: 10655140Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 05953927 (Generated: 09/20/2023 13:24:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUNTER TRIVELLIN - VOLVO9010

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411783 --- --- ---Sample Date 18 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 39.0 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.37 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 113269 --- --- ---Particles >6µm 13014 --- --- ---Particles >14µm 42 --- --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/21/13 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 22 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 80 --- --- ---Copper ppm 21 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 8 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 108 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 379 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 195 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 05953927 (Generated: 09/20/2023 13:24:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUNTER TRIVELLIN - VOLVO9010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR305CL 110653\Hydraulic System [VCP411783] 18 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

