
[[606949 ALTA RENTS]] TAKEUCHI TL10 410006539 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP432760
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 606949 ALTA RENTS

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a moderateamount of silt (particulates < 14microns in size) present in the oil. Theoil viscosity is higher than normal.Additive levels indicate the additionof a different brand, or type of oil.Confirm oil type. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10655147Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 25 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05953934 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:32:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432760 VCP411733 VCP398464 ---Sample Date 14 Sep 2023 31 May 2023 21 Mar 2023 ---Machine Hours 977 437 169 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status ATTENTION ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 56.85 46.4 50.2 ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.89 0.88 0.84 ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 7117 17222 16803 ---Particles >6µm 1606 3590 3458 ---Particles >14µm 134 168 256 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 20/18/14 21/19/15 21/19/15 ---Silicon ppm 4 6 6 ---Sodium ppm 3 2 1 ---Potassium ppm 1 0 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 8 4 3 ---Copper ppm 15 10 5 ---Lead ppm 1 2 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 32 16 16 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 ---Silver ppm <1 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2501 3635 3624 ---Magnesium ppm 330 12 13 ---Zinc ppm 827 692 667 ---Phosphorus ppm 605 551 547 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 19 13 13 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 05953934 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:32:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	TAKEUCHI TAKEUCHI TL10 410006539\Hydraulic System [VCP432760] 14 Sep 2023 @ 977.0 hrs

