
VOLVO SD115B 236651 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP411983
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No:

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Theiron level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount ofparticulates present in the oil.Viscosity of sample indicates oil iswithin ISO 68 range, adviseinvestigate. Confirm oil type. The ANlevel is acceptable for this fluid.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10655157Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 25 Sep 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05953944 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:32:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411983 VCP350173 VCP322144 VCP301582Sample Date 23 Aug 2023 02 May 2022 15 Sep 2021 10 Feb 2021Machine Hours 0 2754 2331 1548Oil Hours 0 754 1500 1548Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 59.92 50.4 51.3 54.12Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.35 0.43 0.395 0.264
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 128641 13186 16842 41241Particles >6µm 36804 2547 207 1047Particles >14µm 3487 186 3 29ISO 4406:1999 (c) 24/22/19 21/19/15 21/15/9 23/17/12Silicon ppm 2 2 4 1Sodium ppm 1 <1 1 0Potassium ppm <1 0 2 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 42 13 35 37Copper ppm 17 8 18 15Lead ppm 3 <1 4 7Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 0 <1 <1 0Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 4 0 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 65 108 87 106Magnesium ppm 9 8 <1 <1Zinc ppm 436 387 345 322Phosphorus ppm 259 345 390 412Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 4 4 1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05953944 (Generated: 09/26/2023 14:32:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO SD115B 236651\Hydraulic System [VCP411983] 23 Aug 2023 @ .0 hrs

