
[[RENTAL]] VOLVO A40G 340097 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP425011
Oil Type: VOLVO WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL
Job No: RENTAL

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
 

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10655594Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05954381 (Generated: 09/20/2023 15:19:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP425011 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Aug 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5294 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.2 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 --- --- ---Copper ppm 9 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 88 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 429 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 366 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 0 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 05954381 (Generated: 09/20/2023 15:19:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 340097\Brake Cooling System [VCP425011] 11 Aug 2023 @ 5294.0 hrs

