
[[SW-23802-2 CASTLE VA]] VOLVO EC480E 314667 - LEFT SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP412483
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 80W-90 GL-5
Job No: SW-23802-2 CASTLE VA

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TONY PAYANtpayan@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10655619Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 05954406 (Generated: 09/20/2023 14:23:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412483 VCP400937 VCP396451 VCP346335Sample Date 11 Sep 2023 24 Apr 2023 17 Nov 2022 03 Jun 2022Machine Hours 4022 3144 2134 1014Oil Hours 1000 1000 1000 1014Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 161 161 151 174
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 5 3 8 11Sodium ppm 1 <1 <1 2Potassium ppm <1 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 160 106 481 85Copper ppm 4 3 9 15Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 1 1Chromium ppm 2 2 7 1Molybdenum ppm 34 62 2 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm 2 2 5 2Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 6 14 6 5Magnesium ppm 0 2 1 0Zinc ppm 0 30 40 13Phosphorus ppm 931 894 987 327Barium ppm 0 0 0 5Boron ppm 156 160 134 9

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 05954406 (Generated: 09/20/2023 14:23:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TONY PAYAN - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480E 314667\Left Swing Drive [VCP412483] 11 Sep 2023 @ 4022.0 hrs

