
[[11097]] VOLVO ECR235D 210351 - SWING DRIVE

Sample No: VCP440531
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: 11097

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10655628Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 20 Sep 2023
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05954415 (Generated: 09/20/2023 03:19:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440531 VCP399879 VCP358751 VCP348521Sample Date 13 Sep 2023 13 Jan 2023 31 May 2022 21 Jan 2022Machine Hours 8650 7920 7494 7230Oil Hours 0 0 0 500Oil Changed N/A Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 286 309 315 309
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 6 4 3 4Sodium ppm 1 2 <1 <1Potassium ppm <1 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 100 83 20 50Copper ppm 4 3 2 22Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 <1 0Aluminum ppm 1 0 <1 0Chromium ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 1 1 1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm 2 1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 102 46 42 107Magnesium ppm 8 9 7 7Zinc ppm 21 1 23 41Phosphorus ppm 763 866 830 885Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 126 137 162 145

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 05954415 (Generated: 09/20/2023 03:20:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO ECR235D 210351\Swing Drive [VCP440531] 13 Sep 2023 @ 8650.0 hrs

