
[[9599]] VOLVO EC350E 314220 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP413782
Oil Type: CHEVRON 15W40
Job No: 9599

RECYCLE 14700 LAWRENCE STHYATTSVILLE, MDUS  20781Contact: MIKE DESJARDINSmdesjarkins@wbwaste.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental level of silicon(Si) above normal indicating ingressof seal material. The BN resultindicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: RECHYAUnique No: 10657348Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 21 Sep 2023
Report Id: RECHYA [WUSCAR] 05956135 (Generated: 10/01/2023 05:46:39) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DESJARDINS - RECHYA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413782 VCP322128 VCP316388 VCP323698Sample Date 12 Sep 2023 27 Jan 2022 20 Jul 2021 18 May 2021Machine Hours 3967 2187 992 581Oil Hours 0 500 500 581Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.8 13.1 12.1 12.4Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 4.2 6.6 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 61 52 83 66
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 68 62 63 62Sulfation (PA) % 63 55 62 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 0.3Silicon ppm 66 8 15 25Sodium ppm 4 2 2 3Potassium ppm 2 <1 0 4
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 4 5 11Copper ppm 5 6 75 267Lead ppm 4 1 1 1Tin ppm <1 <1 1 3Aluminum ppm 2 1 <1 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 6 7 41 14Nickel ppm 3 0 0 1Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2321 2268 1674 2192Magnesium ppm 86 95 454 108Zinc ppm 1153 1089 1006 1029Phosphorus ppm 911 885 852 893Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 3 11 20 8

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RECHYA [WUSCAR] 05956135 (Generated: 10/01/2023 05:46:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE DESJARDINS - RECHYA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350E 314220\Diesel Engine [VCP413782] 12 Sep 2023 @ 3967.0 hrs

