
[[9569]] VOLVO A30G 742602 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP426169
Oil Type: CHEVRON 15W40
Job No: 9569

PLEASANT EXCAVATING COMPANY INC24024 FREDERICK ROADCLARKSBURG, MDUS  20871Contact: H TRENTHTRENT@PLEASANTS.ORGT: (301)252-5635F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: PLECLAUnique No: 10657352Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 21 Sep 2023
Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 05956139 (Generated: 09/21/2023 05:29:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426169 VCP393479 VCP379389 VCP341122Sample Date 11 Sep 2023 23 Feb 2023 16 Sep 2022 21 Jun 2022Machine Hours 3908 3404 2849 2518Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 12.35 12.6 12.3Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.0 7.4 8.9 8.2Oxidation (PA) % 58 67 67 64
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.4 0.3 0.4Nitration (PA) % 59 67 59 69Sulfation (PA) % 58 63 65 63Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 6 5 4Sodium ppm <1 2 1 8Potassium ppm <1 2 2 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 7 5 8Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 1Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 2 2Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 82 118 95 96Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1493 1559 1453 1562Magnesium ppm 384 608 449 526Zinc ppm 1165 957 998 844Phosphorus ppm 966 726 823 670Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 313 269 309 250

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 05956139 (Generated: 09/21/2023 05:29:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 742602\Diesel Engine [VCP426169] 11 Sep 2023 @ 3908.0 hrs

