
[[9570]] VOLVO A30G 742606 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP413783
Oil Type: CHEVRON 15W40
Job No: 9570

PLEASANT EXCAVATING COMPANY INC24024 FREDERICK ROADCLARKSBURG, MDUS  20871Contact: H TRENTHTRENT@PLEASANTS.ORGT: (301)252-5635F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of fuel present inthe oil. Tests confirm the presence offuel in the oil. The BN result indicatesthat there is suitable alkalinityremaining in the oil. Fuel is present inthe oil and is lowering the viscosity.The oil is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: PLECLAUnique No: 10657356Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 21 Sep 2023
Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 05956143 (Generated: 09/21/2023 09:35:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413783 VCP392770 VCP366628 VCP361912Sample Date 14 Sep 2023 23 Feb 2023 29 Aug 2022 06 Apr 2022Machine Hours 4157 3666 3128 2616Oil Hours 0 0 0 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 11.5 12.0 11.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.7 7.3 9.7 8.8Oxidation (PA) % 66 59 59 66
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.3 0.5 0.4Nitration (PA) % 52 61 65 70Sulfation (PA) % 57 58 56 65Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 7.6 5.1 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 6 4 5Sodium ppm 2 1 0 <1Potassium ppm <1 2 2 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 6 9 10Copper ppm <1 <1 2 1Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 1 2 2 4Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 48 92 62 106Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1616 1564 1158 1588Magnesium ppm 407 521 732 613Zinc ppm 1092 994 1113 900Phosphorus ppm 904 760 942 754Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 129 242 32 266

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 05956143 (Generated: 09/21/2023 09:35:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A30G 742606\Diesel Engine [VCP413783] 14 Sep 2023 @ 4157.0 hrs

