
[[9633]] VOLVO EC250E 314006 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP413780
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO GEAR ESI OIL 85W140
Job No: 9633

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO INC MAIN4601 WASHINGTON BOULEVARDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21227Contact: MARK CIULLAmciulla@mcclung-logan.comT: (410)242-6500F: (410)242-7835
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you check for the sourceof water entry. The oil change at thetime of sampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.There is a moderate concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0150Unique No: 10657916Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 22 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05956703 (Generated: 09/25/2023 08:45:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413780 VCP302513 VCP297081 ---Sample Date 13 Sep 2023 14 Jun 2021 16 Dec 2020 ---Machine Hours 2515 1507 1116 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL ATTENTION ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 328 169 141 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.674 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 264 64 18 ---Sodium ppm 36 4 3 ---Potassium ppm 16 <1 0 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1309 589 482 ---Copper ppm 2 <1 <1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm <1 <1 0 ---Aluminum ppm 29 29 4 ---Chromium ppm 15 14 14 ---Molybdenum ppm 2 2 2 ---Nickel ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Titanium ppm 3 2 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Manganese ppm 12 7 6 ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 27 37 44 ---Magnesium ppm 5 4 <1 ---Zinc ppm 10 28 34 ---Phosphorus ppm 1050 1551 1762 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 164 120 111 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05956703 (Generated: 09/25/2023 08:45:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250E 314006\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP413780] 13 Sep 2023 @ 2515.0 hrs

