
[[9594]] VOLVO L90G 3163 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP416477
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 9594

IAA - INSURANCE AUTO AUCTIONS - BALTIMORE3131 HAWKINS POINT RDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21226Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the component.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: IAABALUnique No: 10657932Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 22 Sep 2023
Report Id: IAABAL [WUSCAR] 05956719 (Generated: 10/01/2023 05:44:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - IAABAL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416477 VCP360340 VCP242044 VCP218987Sample Date 15 Sep 2023 20 May 2022 14 Mar 2019 24 May 2018Machine Hours 16208 14701 12114 10637Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL ABNORMAL ATTENTION ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.5 43.0 133.0 40.6
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 9 8 9 53Sodium ppm 2 1 <1 1Potassium ppm <1 0 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 13 11 16 126Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 2Lead ppm 0 <1 0 0Tin ppm 0 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 0 3Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 3 <1 <1 0Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1807 2004 2995 2426Magnesium ppm 39 15 6 9Zinc ppm 944 961 1315 1076Phosphorus ppm 751 790 916 866Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 77 72 85 68

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: IAABAL [WUSCAR] 05956719 (Generated: 10/01/2023 05:44:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - IAABAL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90G 3163\Front Axle [VCP416477] 15 Sep 2023 @ 16208.0 hrs

