
[[9633 LENNOFFS]] VOLVO EC250E 314006 - REAR LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP413774
Oil Type: CHEVRON DELO GEAR ESI OIL 85W140
Job No: 9633 LENNOFFS

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO INC MAIN4601 WASHINGTON BOULEVARDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21227Contact: MARK CIULLAmciulla@mcclung-logan.comT: (410)242-6500F: (410)242-7835
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. Elemental levels ofsilicon (Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0150Unique No: 10657933Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 22 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05956720 (Generated: 09/22/2023 12:55:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413774 VCP302514 VCP290825 ---Sample Date 13 Sep 2023 14 Jun 2021 16 Dec 2020 ---Machine Hours 2515 1507 1116 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status SEVERE ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 371 261 133 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 3.75 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 924 150 97 ---Sodium ppm 102 5 4 ---Potassium ppm 66 3 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1478 681 869 ---Copper ppm 1 <1 1 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Tin ppm 2 <1 <1 ---Aluminum ppm 280 66 33 ---Chromium ppm 25 14 22 ---Molybdenum ppm 2 2 2 ---Nickel ppm 4 <1 1 ---Titanium ppm 16 5 4 ---Silver ppm 0 2 5 ---Manganese ppm 18 8 11 ---Vanadium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 95 30 12 ---Magnesium ppm 71 12 4 ---Zinc ppm 42 26 25 ---Phosphorus ppm 1027 1172 1685 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 179 169 102 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0150 [WUSCAR] 05956720 (Generated: 09/22/2023 12:55:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MARK CIULLA - VOLVO0150
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC250E 314006\Rear Left Final Drive [VCP413774] 13 Sep 2023 @ 2515.0 hrs

