
[[9594]] VOLVO L90G 3163 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP416475
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: 9594

IAA - INSURANCE AUTO AUCTIONS - BALTIMORE3131 HAWKINS POINT RDBALTIMORE, MDUS  21226Contact: Service Manager
T: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: IAABALUnique No: 10657934Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 21 Sep 2023
Report Id: IAABAL [WUSCAR] 05956721 (Generated: 09/21/2023 15:44:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - IAABAL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416475 VCP360398 VCP237740 VCP190179Sample Date 15 Sep 2023 20 May 2022 14 Mar 2019 24 May 2018Machine Hours 16208 14701 12114 10637Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.2 42.4 49.08 42.82
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 33 8 10 11Sodium ppm 5 1 1 1Potassium ppm 1 0 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 44 18 25 53Copper ppm 2 7 3 6Lead ppm <1 0 2 0Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm 3 <1 0 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 1 0 0Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 0Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3777 2981 3952 3954Magnesium ppm 63 20 9 13Zinc ppm 1552 1291 1588 1521Phosphorus ppm 1267 1118 1110 1155Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 157 107 110 108

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: IAABAL [WUSCAR] 05956721 (Generated: 09/21/2023 15:44:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Service Manager - IAABAL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L90G 3163\Rear Axle [VCP416475] 15 Sep 2023 @ 16208.0 hrs

