
[[W06005608 TRIPLE B]] VOLVO A40E 11607 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP411653
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: W06005608 TRIPLE B

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC2025 COOK DRIVESALEM, VAUS  24153Contact: HUNTER TRIVELLINttrivellin@mcclung-logan.comT: (540)789-3750F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Fuel content negligible.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid.

Depot: VOLVO9010Unique No: 10658020Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 05956807 (Generated: 09/22/2023 15:55:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUNTER TRIVELLIN - VOLVO9010

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP411653 --- --- ---Sample Date 11 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 14035 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.3 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.9 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 51 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 43 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 49 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 1.7 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 66 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1213 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 915 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1287 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1093 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 53 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 05956807 (Generated: 09/22/2023 15:55:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUNTER TRIVELLIN - VOLVO9010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40E 11607\Diesel Engine [VCP411653] 11 Sep 2023 @ 14035.0 hrs

