
[[SPM580672 MILBURN DE]] VOLVO EC300DL 210200 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP420695
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SPM580672 MILBURN DE

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. We were unable toperform a particle count due to ahigh concentration of particlespresent in this sample.All componentwear rates are normal. Moderateconcentration of visible dirt/debrispresent in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10658209Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05956996 (Generated: 09/22/2023 16:53:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420695 VCP343319 VCP285746 ---Sample Date 12 Sep 2023 24 Jan 2022 22 Aug 2020 ---Machine Hours 5950 5355 4200 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.4 43.5 43.3 ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.60 0.668 0.864 ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm --- 8273 133038 ---Particles >6µm --- 190 42139 ---Particles >14µm --- 11 6312 ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- 20/15/11 24/23/20 ---Silicon ppm 8 4 5 ---Sodium ppm 2 0 1 ---Potassium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 9 7 8 ---Copper ppm 24 17 32 ---Lead ppm <1 <1 1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm <1 0 0 ---Chromium ppm 5 4 3 ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 0 0 0 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 610 156 241 ---Magnesium ppm 10 7 0 ---Zinc ppm 1008 909 851 ---Phosphorus ppm 778 742 696 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 15 2 5 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 05956996 (Generated: 09/22/2023 16:53:49) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC300DL 210200\Hydraulic System [VCP420695] 12 Sep 2023 @ 5950.0 hrs

