
VOLVO L70CBM 11441 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP417042
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No:

McClung-Logan Virginia LLC2025 COOK DRIVESALEM, VAUS  24153Contact: HUNTER TRIVELLINttrivellin@mcclung-logan.comT: (540)789-3750F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of metal. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor. Wewere unable to perform a particlecount due to metal particles presentin this sample.Moderateconcentration of visible metalpresent. All component wear ratesare normal. No other contaminantswere detected in the oil. Viscosity ofsample indicates oil is within ISO 68range, advise investigate. Confirm oiltype. The AN level is acceptable forthis fluid.

Depot: VOLVO9010Unique No: 10658223Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 22 Sep 2023
Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 05957010 (Generated: 09/25/2023 08:08:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUNTER TRIVELLIN - VOLVO9010

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP417042 --- --- ---Sample Date 12 Sep 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 19108 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 63.7 --- --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.46 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 --- --- ---Copper ppm 3 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 0 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 0 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 242 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 475 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 393 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 5 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 05957010 (Generated: 09/25/2023 08:08:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUNTER TRIVELLIN - VOLVO9010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70CBM 11441\Hydraulic System [VCP417042] 12 Sep 2023 @ 19108.0 hrs

